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A masterly new translation of one of the first great modernist novels

In the only novel by one of the German language's greatest poets, a young man named Malte Laurids Brigge
lives in a cheap room in Paris while his belongings rot in storage. Every person he sees seems to carry their
death with them, and with little but a library card to distinguish him from the city's untouchables, he thinks
of the deaths, and ghosts, of his aristocratic family, of which he is the sole living descendant. Suffused with
passages of lyrical brilliance, Rilke's semi-autobiographical novel is a moving and powerful coming-of-age
story.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Leta Welter:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make one feel bored faster.
And you have extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that
question due to the fact just their can do that. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person.
Yes, it is right. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this The Notebooks of Malte Laurids
Brigge (Penguin Classics) to read.

Terry Grissom:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained within the straightway,
hold on guys this particular aren't like that. This The Notebooks of Malte Laurids Brigge (Penguin Classics)
book is readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable examining experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you.
The writer of The Notebooks of Malte Laurids Brigge (Penguin Classics) content conveys the thought easily
to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just
different such as it. So , do you even now thinking The Notebooks of Malte Laurids Brigge (Penguin
Classics) is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Ronald Karl:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting The Notebooks of Malte
Laurids Brigge (Penguin Classics) that give your fun preference will be satisfied by reading this book.
Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world better then how they
react to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading practice only for the geeky particular person
but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through
as your good habit, you may pick The Notebooks of Malte Laurids Brigge (Penguin Classics) become your
starter.

Michael Watkins:

This The Notebooks of Malte Laurids Brigge (Penguin Classics) is great book for you because the content
and that is full of information for you who else always deal with world and get to make decision every
minute. That book reveal it facts accurately using great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences in
it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight
forward sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having The Notebooks of
Malte Laurids Brigge (Penguin Classics) in your hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not



ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen second right but
this publication already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt in
which?
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