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This engaging book traces the global history of marijuana, reaching back thousands of years. Noted historian
John Charles Chasteen follows the use of the drug since Neolithic times, which makes marijuana among the
first domesticated plants. Surprisingly, though, only infrequently has it been used as a recreational drug.
Instead, there is a vibrant spiritual dimension to its long history that has been continually ignored.

Beginning with the familiar “outbreak” of the 1960s, Chasteen unearths successive layers of marijuana’s
history. Written with insight, clarity, sophistication, and good humor, this deeply informed work discusses
the cultivation of cannabis and its many forms, including hemp, one of the world’s principal fiber crops.
After a tour of Latin America, Africa, India, and the Muslim world, Chasteen concludes that unlike alcohol
marijuana has always flourished outside the mainstream. Its principal users have been creative outsiders of
many kinds—mystics, artists, musicians, free thinkers, and spiritual seekers—as well as poor laborers
attracted by its low cost. Marijuana, it seems, is a mind-expanding drug after all, and Chasteen explores its
rich heritage with captivating insight.
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From reader reviews:

Bruce Brown:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot
of new information. When you read a reserve you will get new information since book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make you more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to imagine the story
how the figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read
this Getting High: Marijuana through the Ages, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about
yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Shane Webb:

The book Getting High: Marijuana through the Ages has a lot associated with on it. So when you read this
book you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author. Tom makes some research
before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point easily after perusing this
book.

Helen Mota:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know everything
we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This guide Getting High: Marijuana through the Ages was filled about science. Spend
your spare time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has distinct feel when
they reading any book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-
book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Paula Lauria:

Guide is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen require book to know the upgrade information of year in order to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world.
By the book Getting High: Marijuana through the Ages we can consider more advantage. Don't that you be
creative people? To become creative person must love to read a book. Simply choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book Getting High: Marijuana
through the Ages. You can more pleasing than now.
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