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Before Julie Callahan came to the house at 9 Highland Road in Glen Cove, New York, she had spent a good
part of her young life in mental hospitals, her mental and emotional coherence nearly destroyed by a
childhood of sexual abuse. Fred Grasso, a schizophrenic, had lived in a filthy single-room occupancy hotel.
At 9 Highland Road they and their housemates were given a decent alternative to lives in institutions or in
the streets. It was a place in which some even found the chance to get better.

This perfectly observed and passionately imagined book takes us inside one of the supervised group homes
that, in an age of shrinking state budgets and psychotropic drugs, have emerged as the backbone of
America's mental health system. As it follows the progress and setbacks of residents, their families, and
counselors and notes the embittered resistance their presence initially aroused in the neighborhood, 9
Highland Road succeeds in opening the locked world of mental illness. It does so with an empathy and
insight that will change forever the way we understand and act in relation to that world.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Nelson:

This book untitled 9 Highland Road: Sane Living for the Mentally Ill to be one of several books this best
seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit on it. You
will easily to buy this kind of book in the book shop or you can order it by way of online. The publisher on
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in
your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this book from your list.

Robert Qualls:

The book 9 Highland Road: Sane Living for the Mentally Ill has a lot associated with on it. So when you
read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer
makes some research before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can find the point
easily after reading this article book.

Randy Scott:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy your
short time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to be study. 9 Highland
Road: Sane Living for the Mentally Ill can be your answer given it can be read by anyone who have those
short spare time problems.

Kenneth Sigler:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is
referred to as of book 9 Highland Road: Sane Living for the Mentally Ill. Contain your knowledge by it.
Without leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is
most important that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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