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This book offers a novel and proven approach to the retention and success of underrepresented students. It
advocates a strategic approach through which an institution sets clear goals and metrics and integrates the
identity support work of cultural / diversity centers with skill building through cohort activities, enabling
students to successfully navigate college, graduate on time and transition to the world of work. Underlying
the process is an intersectional and identity-conscious, rather than identity-centered, framework that
addresses the complexity of students’ assets and needs as they encounter the unfamiliar terrain of college.

In the current landscape of higher education, colleges and universities normally divide their efforts between
departments and programs that explicitly work on developing students’ identities and separate departments
or programs that work on retaining and graduating higher-risk students. This book contends that the gap
between cultural/diversity centers and institutional retention efforts is both a missed opportunity and one that
perpetuates the opportunity gap between students of color and low-income students and their peers.

Identity-consciousness, the central framework of this book, differs from an identity-centric approach where
the identity itself is the focus of the intervention. For example, a Latino men’s program can be developed as
an identity-centered initiative if the outcomes of the program are all tied to a deeper or more complex
understanding of one’s Latino-ness and/or masculinity. Alternately, this same program can be an identity-
conscious student success program if it is designed from the ground up with the students’ racial and gender
identities in mind, but the intended outcomes are tied to student success, such as term-to-term credit
completion, yearly persistence, engagement in high-impact practices, or timely graduation.

Following the introductory chapter focused on framing how we understand risk and success in the academy,
the remaining chapters present programmatic interventions that have been tested and found effective for
students of color, working class college students, and first-generation students. Each chapter opens with a
student story to frame the problem, outlines the key research that informs the program, and offers sufficient
descriptive information for staff or faculty considering implementing a similar identity-conscious
intervention on their campus. The chapters conclude with a discussion of assessment, and suggested “Action
Items” as starting points.

 Download Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious St ...pdf

 Read Online Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious ...pdf

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=B01C7JR8A6


Download and Read Free Online Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious Strategies for
Retention and Student Success

From reader reviews:

Christy Brodersen:

The book Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious Strategies for Retention and Student Success
give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable far more increase.
Book can to become your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem together with your
subject. If you can make reading through a book Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious Strategies
for Retention and Student Success being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your
capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You can know everything if you like
open up and read a reserve Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious Strategies for Retention and
Student Success. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other people.
So , how do you think about this reserve?

Elizabeth Cao:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have extra time?
What did you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that question mainly because
just their can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate.
Because start from on guardería until university need this Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious
Strategies for Retention and Student Success to read.

Curtis Miller:

The e-book untitled Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious Strategies for Retention and Student
Success is the publication that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the reserve content
that will be shown to you actually. The language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to
understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, therefore the information that
they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Closing the Opportunity
Gap: Identity-Conscious Strategies for Retention and Student Success from the publisher to make you much
more enjoy free time.

Mary Chapa:

The book untitled Closing the Opportunity Gap: Identity-Conscious Strategies for Retention and Student
Success contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains the girl idea with easy means. The language is
very clear and understandable all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was
compiled by famous author. The author provides you in the new era of literary works. It is easy to read this
book because you can read on your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book in anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and order



it. Have a nice learn.
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