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Tales of Cajuns, Creoles, and New Orleans decadence dominate both popular and professional impressions
of Louisiana and have undoubtedly distracted attention from the region that arguably experienced the most
dramatic pattern of development in Louisiana, if not the entire Gulf South. Louisiana's Florida Parishes,
located in the southeastern part of the state, have endured a tumultuous evolution, including domination by
every major power that invaded North America, exclusion from the Louisiana Purchase, insurrection and the
establishment of the original Lone Star Republic, and some of the highest rates of rural homicide recorded in
American history. The area was long neglected by scholars until some of its foremost experts came together
to explore and recognize its singular identity. This volume is a result of that collaboration and consists of ten
essays on the history and culture of this unique territory.

In tracing the progress of Louisiana's Florida Parishes, the book begins with an eye-opening ethnographic
history of the territory during its days as a French colony, the brief era of British rule, and slavery as it was
practiced under the Spanish regime. A revealing look at the region during the War of 1812 provides a
dynamic account of the only major naval battle in the South during that conflict. Subsequent essays give
lucid and insightful examination to the area's guerrilla tactics during the Civil War, credit crisis of the
postbellum era, and ecological transformation through pine forest harvesting. The final third of the book
considers the demographic changes wrought by black labor employed in the lumber mills of the early
twentieth century, the challenges confronting a rural, depression-era black community, and recent
environmental changes in the parishes that impact ongoing economic development.

A Fierce and Fractious Frontier employs a comprehensive approach supported by provocative
groundbreaking research to explain the difficulties of the past and suggest considerations for the future of
Louisiana's Florida Parishes. It will stand as a model for the emerging field of southern subregional studies.
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From reader reviews:

Theresa Pepper:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can realize everything you want by a book. Book
has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A guide A Fierce and Fractious Frontier: The Curious
Development of Louisiana's Florida Parishes, 1699--2000 will make you to end up being smarter. You can
feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that will open or reading
some sort of book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you in
search of best book or appropriate book with you?

Andrew Blanton:

Do you one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This A Fierce and Fractious Frontier: The Curious Development of Louisiana's
Florida Parishes, 1699--2000 book is readable simply by you who hate those perfect word style. You will
find the information here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving perhaps decrease the
knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer involving A Fierce and Fractious Frontier: The Curious
Development of Louisiana's Florida Parishes, 1699--2000 content conveys the thought easily to understand
by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different in the form
of it. So , do you nevertheless thinking A Fierce and Fractious Frontier: The Curious Development of
Louisiana's Florida Parishes, 1699--2000 is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Randy Jones:

Typically the book A Fierce and Fractious Frontier: The Curious Development of Louisiana's Florida
Parishes, 1699--2000 has a lot associated with on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of
gain. The book was authored by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research prior to write this
book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this article book.

James Longo:

This A Fierce and Fractious Frontier: The Curious Development of Louisiana's Florida Parishes, 1699--2000
is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of information for you who have always deal with
world and get to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it details accurately using great
arrange word or we can point out no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have
whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but hard core information with
attractive delivering sentences. Having A Fierce and Fractious Frontier: The Curious Development of
Louisiana's Florida Parishes, 1699--2000 in your hand like having the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous a single. We can say that no guide that offer you world inside ten or fifteen moment right but this
e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt



this?
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