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"Seagirl" by H. L. Blake is a young adult realistic fiction novel with fantasy elements. "First: She had not
drowned; her mother had. Second: It had been her idea. Third: The secret longing. Hard to explain,
impossible to explain really, but even more impossible to stop feeling." Serena's story begins with a death
and ends with a choice to live. Her mother has drowned by the story's opening, and Serena blames herself.
Her choice remains what she will do now - if she will continue to search for her mother in the depths and
darkness, or follow in the wake of her largely absent father, or somehow find her own way back to the
surface of light and life. Serena treads water and struggles for survival, fighting for every breath, until an
unexpected hand reaches out to help. She is reluctantly won over by the insistent friendship of Dylan and his
adopted sister Ellie, whose kindred understanding of grief helps her overcome her own. Weaving through the
narrative is a thread of realistic fantasy, the myths of selkies and mermaids hinted at the edges of the story
and reflecting the themes of loss and love. In the end, Serena must face her nightmares on a return trip to the
ocean she once loved. Only then is she able to fight her way through and make her ultimate decision - to
stay, live, love - or leave.
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From reader reviews:

Myron Abbott:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book Seagirl. You can choose the best book if you like
reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book Seagirl. You can add knowledge and of
course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can understand
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple
factor until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we can open a book or perhaps searching
by internet unit. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's
learn.

Anthony Wood:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book Seagirl. All type of book are
you able to see on many methods. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Alice Wilkerson:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information these days can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which
one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
get it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not happen
in you if you take Seagirl as your daily resource information.

Linda Cooper:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Seagirl was vibrant and of course has pictures
around. As we know that book Seagirl has many kinds or category. Start from kids until teens. For example
Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. So , not at all of
book are generally make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best
book for you and try to like reading in which.
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