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During the early years of the motion picture industry, black performers were often depicted as shuckin’ and
jivin’ caricatures. Specifically, black males were portrayed as toms, coons and bucks, while the mammy and
tragic mulatto archetypes circumscribed black femininity. This misrepresentation began to change in the
1950s and 1960s when performers such as Dorothy Dandridge and Sidney Poitier were cast in more positive
roles. These performers paved the way for the black exploitation or blaxploitation movement, which began in
1970 and flourished until 1975. The movement is characterized by films that feature a black hero or heroine,
black supporting characters, a predominately black urban setting, a display of black sexuality, excessive
violence, and a contemporary rhythm and blues soundtrack. Blaxploitation films were made across varying
genres, but the questionable elements of some of the pictures caused them to be referred to as
"blaxploitation" films with little or no regard given to their generic categorization. This book examines how
Cotton Comes to Harlem (1970), Blacula (1972), The Mack (1973), and Cleopatra Jones (1973) can be
classified within the detective, horror, gangster, and cop action genres, respectively, and illustrates the
manner in which the inclusion of "blackness" represents a significant revision to the aforementioned genres.
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From reader reviews:

Gary Forsyth:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different
you can read a book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole
day to reading a reserve. The book Blaxploitation Films of the 1970s: Blackness and Genre (Studies in
African American History and Culture) it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough
space to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from a smart
phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses high quality.

Cathryn Walker:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Blaxploitation Films of the 1970s:
Blackness and Genre (Studies in African American History and Culture), you are able to enjoy both. It is
excellent combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh come on its mind
hangout fellas. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Jerry Melgar:

Blaxploitation Films of the 1970s: Blackness and Genre (Studies in African American History and Culture)
can be one of your basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this book
has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining
but nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to set every word into
delight arrangement in writing Blaxploitation Films of the 1970s: Blackness and Genre (Studies in African
American History and Culture) although doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest along
with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information could
drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial imagining.

Tanya Wilson:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When you
learn a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us



novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Blaxploitation Films of the 1970s: Blackness and Genre (Studies in
African American History and Culture) will give you new experience in examining a book.
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