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The New York Times bestselling author of Ming Tea Murder serves up heists, homicides, and herbal
blends in the latest in the Tea Shop mysteries.
 
Catering a high-class trunk show at Heart's Desire Jewelry is a shining achievement for Theodosia and the
Indigo Tea Shop. After all, a slew of jewelers, museum curators, and private collectors will be there to
showcase their wares and sip some of Theo's best blends. But just as Theo settles in to enjoy the fruits of her
labor, the party is crashed by a gang of masked muggers who steal the precious gems and jewels on display.
The thieves disappear almost as quickly as they arrived, leaving shattered glass, scattered gemstones, and a
dead body in their wake. 
 
Although the last thing Theo wants is to get involved, she can't help but intercede when her dear friend
Brooke, aunt of the victim and owner of Heart's Desire, begs for help in figuring out who committed the
brutal burglary. Though the FBI believes this daring "smash and grab" is the work of an international gang of
jewel thieves, Theo is convinced that the felon is someone much closer to home...
 
INCLUDES RECIPES AND TEA TIME TIPS!

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Cary Barrett:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like reading
through a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you will need this Devonshire Scream (Tea Shop Mysteries Book 17).

Helen Rios:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is
named of book Devonshire Scream (Tea Shop Mysteries Book 17). You can add your knowledge by it.
Without leaving behind the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to
read. It is most important that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a
other place.

Amber Tyson:

Guide is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. By book Devonshire Scream (Tea Shop Mysteries Book 17) we can acquire more advantage. Don't
that you be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Only choose the best book
that ideal with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life by this book Devonshire Scream (Tea
Shop Mysteries Book 17). You can more inviting than now.

Rachel Addison:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone.
From media social such as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just searching for the Devonshire Scream (Tea Shop Mysteries Book 17) when you needed it?
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