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"A great novel that captures the loneliness and absurdity of the 1990s suburban experience. Dense and
imaginative writing that often borders on the uncomfortable, but the edge of your seat is the best place to
be."—Joel Plaskett

It is the summer of 1999, and the Sweltham family is leading an ordinary suburban existence. Former
childhood volleyball champ Parker crisscrosses the continent as a sales rep for DynaFlex Sporting Goods,
while his wife, Trixie, serves as the managing editor of Record of Truth, an unsuccessful journal for
genocide studies. Their son Owen has just returned from juvenile prison to the vast horrors of high school.
Heath, Parker's brother, has vowed to cut down on the weed and fried chicken for a regimen of self-
improvement, obeying his AbDestroyer routine and crafting a screenplay that will dismantle the universe.
All appears normal.

Yet in the summer's swelter, as Y2K anxiety grows, grim truths are revealed. Trixie is rocked by the
discovery of an undiagnosable cerebral defect, rendering her toils at the journal trivial. Cataloging crunches
and ignoring his Gulf War vet ex-girlfriend, Heath fights to reconcile confusions of the past with hopes for a
meaningful future. Owen's religious fixations feed his Robitussin binges and fantasies of self-destruction.
And while peddling his wares at the annual Empowerment Expo, Parker forges an uneasy friendship with
Adam, an African political refugee harboring his own violent aspirations.

Sprawling yet scalpel-sharp, Maintenance, like some twenty-first-century White Noise, takes the suburbs to a
geography you won't quite recognize.

Rob Benvie has recorded and performed with the rock bands Thrush Hermit, Camouflage Nights, and The
Dears. He is the author of the novel Safety of War.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Zakrzewski:

As people who live in the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
you is you don't know what one you should start with. This Maintenance is our recommendation to cause
you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Ida Hamilton:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your free
of charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If
you want to test look for book, may be the book untitled Maintenance can be very good book to read. May be
it might be best activity to you.

Byron Angle:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart and
soul or real their passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
right now there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you.
As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Maintenance can make you really feel more interested to read.

Jillian Diaz:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when they get a
half parts of the book. You can choose the book Maintenance to make your own reading is interesting. Your
current skill of reading expertise is developing when you including reading. Try to choose easy book to make
you enjoy to see it and mingle the feeling about book and looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you
to like to open a book and read it. Beside that the book Maintenance can to be your friend when you're truly
feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of this time.
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