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Prisoners of Shangri-La is a provocative analysis of the romance of Tibet, a romance that, even as it is
invoked by Tibetan lamas living in exile, ultimately imprisons those who seek the goal of Tibetan
independence from Chinese occupation.

"Lopez lifts the veil on America's romantic vision of Tibet to reveal a country and a spiritual history more
complex and less ideal than popular perceptions allow. . . . Lively and engaging, Lopez's book raises
important questions about how Eastern religions are often co-opted, assimilated and misunderstood by
Western culture."—Publishers Weekly

"Proceeding with care and precision, Lopez reveals the extent to which scholars have behaved like
intellectual colonialists. . . . Someone had to burst the bubble of pop Tibetology, and few could have done it
as resoundingly as Lopez."—Booklist

"Fascinating. . . [A] provocative exploration. Lopez conveys the full dizziness of the Western encounter with
Tibet and Tibetan Buddhism."—Fred Pheil, Tricycle: The Buddhist Review

"A timely and courageous exploration. . . . [Lopez's] book will sharpen the terms of the debate over what the
Tibetans and their observers can or should be doing about the place and the idea of Tibet. And that alone is
what will give us all back our Shambhala."—Jonathan Spence, Lingua Franca Book Review

"Lopez's most important theme is that we should be wary of the idea . . . that Tibet has what the West lacks,
that if we were only to look there we would find the answers to our problems. Lopez's book shows that, on
the contrary, when the West has looked at Tibet, all that it has seen is a distorted reflection of itself."—Ben
Jackson, Times Higher Education Supplement
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From reader reviews:

Marian Sheffield:

The book Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West gives you the sense of being enjoy for
your spare time. You may use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can for being your best friend
when you getting stress or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make studying a book
Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West being your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like open and read a e-book Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think
about this book?

Stewart Ramirez:

This Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West book is not really ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is information inside this
guide incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you
will get. This kind of Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West without we know teach the
one who studying it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Prisoners of
Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West can bring any time you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This Prisoners
of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West having good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not
feel uninterested in reading.

James Ronquillo:

The ability that you get from Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West is the more deep you
searching the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that
this book is hard to comprehend but Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West giving you
enjoyment feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood
through anyone who read the item because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This kind of
book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go along,
both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having that Prisoners of Shangri-La:
Tibetan Buddhism and the West instantly.

Bonnie Camacho:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can
satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be
examine. Prisoners of Shangri-La: Tibetan Buddhism and the West can be your answer mainly because it can



be read by an individual who have those short spare time problems.
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