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"A strong antidote to the growing sinophobia in the U.S."?Wall Street Journal

Many see China and the United States on the path to confrontation. The Chinese leadership violates human
rights norms. It maintains a harsh rule in Tibet, spars aggressively with Taiwan, and is clamping down on
Hong Kong. A rising power with enormous assets, China increasingly considers American interests an
obstacle to its own.

But, the authors argue, the United States is the least of China's problems. Despite its sheer size, economic
vitality, and drive to upgrade its military forces, China remains a vulnerable power, crowded on all sides by
powerful rivals and potential foes. As it has throughout its history, China faces immense security challenges,
and their sources are at and within China's own borders. China's foreign policy is calibrated to defend its
territorial integrity against antagonists who are numerous, near, and strong.

The authors trace the implications of this central point for China's relations with the United States and the
rest of the world.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Tipton:

Typically the book The Great Wall and the Empty Fortress: China's Search for Security has a lot of
knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written by
the very famous author. The writer makes some research just before write this book. This kind of book very
easy to read you can obtain the point easily after reading this book.

Candice Foushee:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just spending
your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. Among the books in the top record in your
reading list is The Great Wall and the Empty Fortress: China's Search for Security. This book that is
certainly qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking up
and review this book you can get many advantages.

Carolyn Rolon:

You may get this The Great Wall and the Empty Fortress: China's Search for Security by check out the
bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties
for your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only simply by written or printed and also can
you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your local
mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about
your guide. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to
choose proper ways for you.

Adam Carter:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is referred to as of
book The Great Wall and the Empty Fortress: China's Search for Security. You can add your knowledge by
it. Without causing the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is
most important that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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