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Born in Ohio in 1842, journalist, short-story writer and critic Ambrose Bierce developed into one of this
country's most celebrated and cynical wits — a merciless "American Swift" whose literary barbs were aimed
at folly, self-delusion, politics, business, religion, literature and the arts. In this splendid "dictionary" of
epigrams, essays, verses and vignettes, you'll find over 1,000 pointed definitions, e.g. Congratulation ("The
civility of envy"), Coward ("One who in a perilous emergency thinks with his legs") and Historian ("A
broad-gauge gossip"). Anyone who likes to laugh will love The Devil's Dictionary. Anyone looking for a bon
mot to enliven their next speech, paper or conversation will have a field day thumbing through what H. L.
Mencken called "some of the most gorgeous witticisms in the English language."
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From reader reviews:

Victor Kohlmeier:

The book The Devil's Dictionary (Dover Thrift Editions) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book The Devil's Dictionary (Dover Thrift
Editions)? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give many data
for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that,
it is possible to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book The Devil's Dictionary (Dover
Thrift Editions) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search
the enormous world by start and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Jacqueline Campbell:

The reserve with title The Devil's Dictionary (Dover Thrift Editions) has a lot of information that you can
learn it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. That book exist new know-how the information that
exist in this publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to be
aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

Allison Devore:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or to make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real their pastime.
They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there but nothing
reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know
that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this The Devil's Dictionary (Dover Thrift Editions) can make you sense more
interested to read.

Jerry Schooler:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from a book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of
news. Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual.
From media social just like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book?
Or just trying to find the The Devil's Dictionary (Dover Thrift Editions) when you desired it?
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