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Cities of Commerce develops a model of institutional change in European commerce based on urban rivalry.
Cities continuously competed with each other by adapting commercial, legal, and financial institutions to the
evolving needs of merchants. Oscar Gelderblom traces the successive rise of Bruges, Antwerp, and
Amsterdam to commercial primacy between 1250 and 1650, showing how dominant cities feared being
displaced by challengers while lesser cities sought to keep up by cultivating policies favorable to trade. He
argues that it was this competitive urban network that promoted open-access institutions in the Low
Countries, and emphasizes the central role played by the urban power holders--the magistrates--in fostering
these inclusive institutional arrangements. Gelderblom describes how the city fathers resisted the predatory
or reckless actions of their territorial rulers, and how their nonrestrictive approach to commercial life
succeeded in attracting merchants from all over Europe.

Cities of Commerce intervenes in an important debate on the growth of trade in Europe before the Industrial
Revolution. Challenging influential theories that attribute this commercial expansion to the political strength
of merchants, this book demonstrates how urban rivalry fostered the creation of open-access institutions in
international trade.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Ward:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider any time
those information which is from the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take Cities of Commerce: The Institutional Foundations of
International Trade in the Low Countries, 1250-1650 (The Princeton Economic History of the Western
World) as your daily resource information.

Chris Holmes:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Cities of Commerce: The Institutional
Foundations of International Trade in the Low Countries, 1250-1650 (The Princeton Economic History of
the Western World), you may enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind
of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as
reading friends.

Angela Strange:

Beside this Cities of Commerce: The Institutional Foundations of International Trade in the Low Countries,
1250-1650 (The Princeton Economic History of the Western World) in your phone, it might give you a way
to get more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you might got here is
fresh through the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow village. It is good
thing to have Cities of Commerce: The Institutional Foundations of International Trade in the Low
Countries, 1250-1650 (The Princeton Economic History of the Western World) because this book offers to
you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you would not get what it's all about. Oh come
on, that will not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the item? Find this book in addition
to read it from at this point!

Pandora Rice:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a guide. They are directly felt this when they get a
half portions of the book. You can choose the actual book Cities of Commerce: The Institutional Foundations



of International Trade in the Low Countries, 1250-1650 (The Princeton Economic History of the Western
World) to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading ability is developing
when you including reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the opinion
about book and looking at especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and go through
it. Beside that the guide Cities of Commerce: The Institutional Foundations of International Trade in the Low
Countries, 1250-1650 (The Princeton Economic History of the Western World) can to be your friend when
you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of the time.
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