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From the Berlin Airlift to the Iraq War, the UN Security Council has stood at the heart of global politics. Part
public theater, part smoke-filled backroom, the Council has enjoyed notable successes and suffered
ignominious failures, but it has always provided a space for the five great powers to sit down together.
Five to Rule Them All tells the inside story of this remarkable diplomatic creation. Drawing on extensive
research, including dozens of interviews with serving and former ambassadors on the Council, the book
chronicles political battles and personality clashes as it opens the closed doors of its meeting room. What
emerges here is a revealing portrait of the most powerful diplomatic body in the world. When the five
permanent members are united, David Bosco points out, the Council can wage war, impose blockades,
redraw borders, unseat governments, and levy sanctions. There are almost no limits to its authority. Yet the
Council exists in a world of realpolitik. Its members are, above all, powerful states with their own diverging
interests. Time and again, the Council's performance has dashed the hope that its members would somehow
work together to establish a more peaceful world. But if these lofty hopes have been unfulfilled, the Council
has still served an invaluable purpose: to prevent conflict between the Great Powers. In this role, the Council
has been an unheralded success. As Bosco reminds us, massacres in the Balkans and chaos in Iraq are human
tragedies, but conflicts between the world's great powers in the nuclear age would be catastrophic.
In this lively, fast-moving, and often humorous narrative, Bosco illuminates the role of the Security Council
in the postwar world, making a compelling case for the enduring importance of the five who rule them all.
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Walker:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics,
and also soon. The Five to Rule Them All: The UN Security Council and the Making of the Modern World
will give you new experience in examining a book.

Eric Sanders:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare?
Why so many query for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book and also novel and Five to Rule Them All: The UN Security
Council and the Making of the Modern World or perhaps others sources were given knowledge for you.
After you know how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science publication was
created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those publications are helping them to include their
knowledge. In different case, beside science book, any other book likes Five to Rule Them All: The UN
Security Council and the Making of the Modern World to make your spare time far more colorful. Many
types of book like this.

Evelyn Nay:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
also native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By the
book Five to Rule Them All: The UN Security Council and the Making of the Modern World we can take
more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To get creative person must love to read a book. Just
choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book Five to
Rule Them All: The UN Security Council and the Making of the Modern World. You can more attractive
than now.

Beth Johnson:

Some people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book Five to Rule Them All: The UN
Security Council and the Making of the Modern World to make your own personal reading is interesting.
Your current skill of reading skill is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book
to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the feeling about book and examining especially. It is to be



initial opinion for you to like to start a book and examine it. Beside that the e-book Five to Rule Them All:
The UN Security Council and the Making of the Modern World can to be your friend when you're sense
alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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