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Hercule Poirot, along with three other luminaries from the world of crime detection, is invited to dinner by
the renowned London socialite Dr Shaitana. Also on the guest list are four members of what Shaitana calls
his Black Museum - a collection of murderers who have each succeeded in 'getting away with it'. An elegant
dinner is followed by a game of bridge, in which Shaitana himself does not participated. But just after
midnight, when the guests prepare to leave, they make a terrible discovery. Their host is dead in his
armchair, stabbed in the chest. The four sleuths are thus faced with one murder and a quartet of likely
suspects. Working both together and independently, they investigate the pasts of the Black Museum's finest
in order to determine the most likely killer. Poirot finds that many hindrances and distractions are thrown in
his way, as he attempts to read the meaning of the cards which each suspect has placed on the table. Agatha
Christie's intriguing mystery is dramatised with a full cast including Stephanie Cole and Donald Sinden.

2 CDs. 1 hr 30 mins.
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Herr:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Cards On The Table (BBC
Audio Crime). All type of book can you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet methods or
other social media.

Marlin Peterson:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their reader with their
story as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
data about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there
are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise in writing,
they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Cards On The Table (BBC
Audio Crime).

Jesus Gates:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
internal or real their leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go
to right now there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along
with can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As
we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this Cards On The Table (BBC Audio Crime) can make you feel more
interested to read.

Patrick Leon:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt this
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book Cards On The Table (BBC Audio
Crime) to make your reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing when you such as
reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and
reading especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to open up a book and go through it. Beside that
the e-book Cards On The Table (BBC Audio Crime) can to be your brand new friend when you're truly feel
alone and confuse in what must you're doing of the time.
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