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This book of poems and stark, vivid illustrations is rooted in the female soul of indigenous Mexico. The
Tzotzil women of the Chiapas Highlands are the poets and the artists. Ambar Past, who collected the poems
and drawings, includes a moving essay about their poetics, beliefs, and history.

In the 1970s, living among the Maya, Past watched the people endure as an epidemic swept through a
village. No help came. Many children died. One mother offered her dead child a last sip of Coca-Cola and
uttered a prayer:

Take this sweet dew from the earth, take this honey. It will help you on your way. It will give you strength on
your path.

Incantations like this—poems about birth, love, hate, sex, despair, and death—coupled with primitive
illustrations, provide a compelling insight into the psychology of these Mayan women poets. The Cinco
Puntos edition of Incantations is a facsimile of the original handmade edition produced by the Taller
Leñateros. It was reviewed in The New York Times.

At the age of twenty-three, Ambar Past left the United States for Mexico. She lived among the Mayan
people, teaching the techniques of native dyes and learning to speak Tzotzil. She is the creator of the graphic
arts collective Taller Leñateros in Chiapas and was a founding member of Sna Jolobil, a weaving cooperative
for Mayan artisans.
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From reader reviews:

Candice Delgado:

This Incantations: Songs, Spells and Images by Mayan Women are generally reliable for you who want to
become a successful person, why. The reason why of this Incantations: Songs, Spells and Images by Mayan
Women can be one of the great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading food but
feed a person with information that perhaps will shock your prior knowledge. This book is actually handy,
you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside
that this Incantations: Songs, Spells and Images by Mayan Women giving you an enormous of experience
like rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day task. So , let's
have it and luxuriate in reading.

Paul Williams:

The e-book untitled Incantations: Songs, Spells and Images by Mayan Women is the e-book that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you. The
language that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article
author was did a lot of research when write the book, therefore the information that they share to your
account is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Incantations: Songs, Spells and Images by
Mayan Women from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Ruby Martinez:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Try and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside look likes. Maybe you answer may be Incantations: Songs, Spells and Images by Mayan Women
why because the amazing cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you. The
inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show
you to pick up this book.

Bruce Harrison:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
internal or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to at
this time there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and
also can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As
we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Incantations: Songs, Spells and Images by Mayan Women can make you truly
feel more interested to read.
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