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A Diary from Dixie is the Civil War diary of Mary Boykin Chesnut, society matron and wife of United States
senator and Confederate general, James Chesnut, Jr. As an active participant in her husband’s career,
accompanying him to postings in Montgomery, Richmond, Charleston, and Columbia, Chesnut became an
eyewitness to many important events of the war, and, despite being a member of the privileged class,
managed to convey the Confederacy’s struggle from different points of view.

A Diary from Dixie is considered by many to be the most important work produced by a Confederate author.
Filmmaker Ken Burns made extensive use of Chesnut’s diary in his documentary series The Civil War, and
an annotated version of it, published by the historian C. Vann Woodward as Mary Chesnut’s Civil War, won
the Pulitzer Prize for History in 1982.

HarperTorch brings great works of non-fiction and the dramatic arts to life in digital format, upholding the
highest standards in ebook production and celebrating reading in all its forms. Look for more titles in the
HarperTorch collection to build your digital library.
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From reader reviews:

Mike Greene:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of various ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading a book will make you more imaginative. When you
reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story how
the figures do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
A Diary from Dixie, it is possible to tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours guide. Your
knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a reserve.

Dora Vazquez:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have you
got when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading publications. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read is definitely A Diary from Dixie.

Rosemary Taylor:

This A Diary from Dixie is brand new way for you who has attention to look for some information because it
relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or else you
who still having little bit of digest in reading this A Diary from Dixie can be the light food for you because
the information inside this book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books create itself in the form
which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in guide form make
them feel drowsy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is no in reading a e-book especially this one.
You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the item! Just read this
e-book sort for your better life as well as knowledge.

Harold Morris:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to
do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. On the list of
books in the top record in your reading list is definitely A Diary from Dixie. This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking way up
and review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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